
Extraordinary Rewards and Scholarships from the Resources of the Coordinator and 
Benefits of the Progres Q18 Program 

 
 
 
1) The coordinator of the Progres Q18 Program, in collaboration with the Council of the 
Program, will propose to the Dean of FSV UK to use the resources of the coordinator and 
benefits to pay out extraordinary rewards and scholarships for excellent results achieved in 
2020 in Progres Q18 by individual researchers, or research teams. 
 
2) Proposals for the reward can be submitted by all employees and doctoral students of the 
FSV UK who act as researchers of Progres Q18. 
 
3) In addition to publication results achieved in 2020, the publication results dated 2019 may 
also seek the award of rewards if they were not applied in 2019 for later publication purposes. 
 
3) When evaluating the results, greater emphasis will be placed on rewarding such activities 
and results that have been generated under Progres Q18 and correspond to the emphasis of the 
program on interdisciplinary and inter-faculty cooperation. 
 
4) The categories and characteristics of the rewarded results are laid out in the Criteria for 
Rewarding Results from the resources of the coordinator of Progres Q18, available at Progres 
Q18 webpages (https://www.fsv.cuni.cz/veda-vyzkum/vnitrouniverzitni-
programy/progres/progres-q18). 
 
5) Only such proposals will be accepted that have been submitted on special forms available 
at Progres Q18 webpages (https://www.fsv.cuni.cz/veda-vyzkum/vnitrouniverzitni-
programy/progres/progres-q18). The proposals must contain all relevant information about the 
nature of the result and its scientific or public significance (including a link to the presentation 
on the web or, where applicable, to the full or at least partial text of the result) and the nature 
of the participation or share of the proposer in its creation. One result cannot be applied in two 
categories at the same time. The results applied in the wrong category will be discarded. 
 
6) In the case of publication results (Group 1) and certified methodology (Group 2), in order 
to award extraordinary rewards or scholarships, these publications need to be reported on 
behalf of FSV to OBD (the personal bibliographic database) and completed for submission to 
RIV (Information Register of R&D results). It is possible to nominate also the results 
published as “online first” with the condition that they have a DOI number that will be put in 
the form. 
 
7) The deadline for submitting the proposals for rewards and extraordinary scholarships starts 
on 16 October and ends on 3 November 2020. 
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